
 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e

c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e

s
ig

n
a

ti
o

n
 o

f 

S
u

b
c

o
n

tr
a

c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 

P
R

E
Q

U
A

L
.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Cement Cutting $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Yes Yes

2 Casper Company $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Yes Yes
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BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-A DEMOLITION

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e

c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e

s
ig

n
a

ti
o

n
 o

f 

S
u

b
c

o
n

tr
a

c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 DEMCON NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE!           Yes Yes

2 MINEGAR NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes Yes

3 SWINERTON CONCRETE $3,653,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,653,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

4 ROCKY COAST CONCRETE $4,077,877.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,077,877.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-B- STRUCTURAL CONCRETE

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e

c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e

s
ig

n
a

ti
o

n
 o

f 

S
u

b
c

o
n

tr
a

c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 

P
R

E
Q

U
A

L
.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Rossin Steel $3,800,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,800,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

2 Progressive Steel NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes Yes

3 South Bay Wedling $5,458,820.00 $3,200.00 $32,000.00 $72,000.00 $5,562,820.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes
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PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-D   STEEL and METAL STAIRS

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e
s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 STOLO $363,720.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $367,720.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

2 SPOONERS WOODWORKS $671,960.00 $1,200.00 $12,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $683,960.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

3 ISEC $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-F  ARCHITECTURAL WOODWORK

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e
s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Roof Construction $152,647.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $157,647.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

2
Commercial and Industrical 

Roofing Co.
NO BID $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

3 Sylvester Roofing NO BID $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-G  ROOFING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e
s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 California Sheet Metal $1,539,883.00 $960.00 $9,600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,549,483.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

2 Burner Sheet Metal $1,055,875.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,065,875.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

3 Challenger Sheet Metal $1,356,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,366,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

12  

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-H SHEET METAL

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e

c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e

s
ig

n
a

ti
o

n
 o

f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 

P
R

E
Q

U
A

L
.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Brady Company $487,825.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $497,825.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

2 Johnson Finch McClure $394,145.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $394,145.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

3 ISEC $479,962.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $494,962.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

4 Design Hardware Co. NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-I  DOORS/FRAMES/HARDWARE 

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e
s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Centex Glazing, Inc NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes Yes

2 La Mesa Glass NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes Yes

3
Sunset Glass (Mesa Contract 

Glazing)
$4,264,248.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,264,248.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-J CURTAIN WALL/GLAZING/STOREFRONTS

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e
s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Superior Door $57,140.00 $9,000.00 $90,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $147,140.00 X X X X X X Yes N/R

2 Vinyard Door NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-K  COILING GRILLES

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e
s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Superior $102,275.00 $7,500.00 $75,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $177,275.00 X X X X X X X

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-L  SMOKE CONTAINMENT DOOR

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Additive Bid 

Alternate #1 

Slab edge 

fire barrier 

 Additive 

Alternate #2 3x3 

16 Ga Outrigger 

weld to bent 

plate 

GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e

s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 

P
R

E
Q

U
A

L
.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Standard Drywall $4,241,000.00 $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $26,250.00 $386,000.00 $4,683,250.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

2 Brady SoCal, Inc. $4,298,650.00 $1,875.00 $18,750.00 $28,230.00 $149,065.00 $4,494,695.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

3 Swinerton Drywall $3,827,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $79,500.00 $58,750.00 $3,965,250.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

4 Johnson Finch McClure $3,337,234.00 $3,300.00 $33,000.00 $41,000.00 $55,000.00 $3,466,234.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

5 Nevell Group, Inc. $3,119,163.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $39,336.00 $32,991.00 $3,216,490.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

6 Raymond San Diego, Inc $3,258,271.00 $6,200.00 $62,000.00 $29,894.00 $55,871.00 $3,406,036.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes
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PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-M FRAMING/DRYWALL/FIREPROOFING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

1

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

2

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

3

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

4

A
D

D
E

N
D

A

5

B
ID

 F
O

R
M

B
ID

 B
O

N
D

B
id

 S
e
c
u

ri
ty

R
E

F
E

R
N

C
E

S

D
e
s
ig

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f 

S
u

b
c
o

n
tr

a
c
to

rs

N
O

N
-C

O
L

L
U

S
IO

N

W
O

R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 WIRTZ  TILE NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

2
CONTINENTAL MARBLE and TILE 

CO.
$498,956.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $498,956.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

3 PRO SPECTRA INSTALLATIONS $471,174.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $472,174.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

12  

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-N  TILING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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N
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R
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R
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N
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O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 BRADY SoCAL, INC $925,800.00 $600.00 $6,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $931,800.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/A

2 ADVANCED ACOUSTICS NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/A

3 DARYL GRIFFIS NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/A

4
ADVANCED ACOUSTICS 

CONTRACTORS, INC
$979,524.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $984,524.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/A
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PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-O  ACOUSTIC CEILINGS

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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D
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N
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N
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R
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R

Y
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O
B

1 DFS FLOORING NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

2 A+S Flooring $455,165.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $457,665.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

3 PRO SPECTRA INSTALLATIONS $516,995.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $517,995.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-P  FINISH FLOORING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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N
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N
D

A
T
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R

Y
 J

O
B

1 GENERAL COATINGS NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/A

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-Q  PAINT and WALLCOVERING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD

A
D

D
E
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D
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D
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N
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R
E

Q
U

A
L

.

A
T

T
E

N
D

E
D

 

M
A

N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Brady $81,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $81,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X N/R N/R

2 ABC School Equip $99,941.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $99,941.00 X X X X X x X X X X X N/R N/R

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-R  VISUAL DISPLAYS

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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N
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R
K

E
R

'S
 C

O
M

P
 

C
E

R
T

B
ID

D
E

R
 P

R
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N
D

A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

4 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-S   SIGNAGE

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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N
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R
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A
T

O
R

Y
 J

O
B

1 DARYL GRIFFIS ACOUSTICS NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

2 ISEC NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

3 BRADY SoCAL, INC. $247,620.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $247,620.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-T   TOILET ACCESSORIES & MISC SPECIALTIES

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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D
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N
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A
L
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N
/R

1 Interra $228,100.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $243,100.00 X X X X X X X X N/R N/R

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC- U   LIBRARY STACK SYSTEMS

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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O
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O
B

1 ISEC $853,518.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $868,518.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

2 DOW DIVERSIFIED $770,425.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $775,425.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-V   FUME HOODS & LAB EQUIPMENT/CASEWORK

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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O
B

1 Diversified $191,916.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $194,916.00 X X X X X X X X X N/R N/R

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-W  ROLLER SHADES

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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B

1 OTIS ELEVATOR $369,312.14 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $369,312.14 X X X X X X X X X X X

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-X ELEVATOR RESTORATION

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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O
B

1 WESTERN FIRE PROTECTION $800,023.00 $1,250.00 $12,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $812,523.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

2 BRADSHAW ENGINEERING CORP $860,630.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $865,630.00 X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

3 SCHMIDT FIRE PROTECTION $810,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $825,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

4 JPI DEVELOPMENT GROUP, INC $691,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $694,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-Y   FIRE SPRINKLERS

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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N
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O
B

1 INTERPIPE $2,286,000.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,287,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

2 ALPHA MECHANICAL, INC. $1,059,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,064,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X

3 JPI DEVELOPMENT, INC. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4 SHERWOOD MECHANICAL $1,610,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,610,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X

5 AO REED CO. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Yes Yes

6 COLLINS PLUMBING $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

7 UNIVERSITY MECHANICAL $1,958,750.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,961,250.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

12  

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-Z   PLUMBING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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1 AO REED $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Yes Yes

2 ALPHA MECHANICAL $3,672,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,677,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

3 UNIVERSITY MECHANICAL $3,934,231.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,936,731.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

4 CONTROL AIR CONDITIONING, INC $3,590,000.00 $3,500.00 $35,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,625,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-AA   HVAC

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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R
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1 Bergelectric $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Yes Yes

2 Baker Electric $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Yes Yes

3 Morrow Meadows Corp $5,649,000.00 $1.00 $10.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,649,010.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

4 Prime $5,516,222.00 $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,546,222.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

5 Ace Electric $4,461,000.00 $7.83 $78.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,461,078.30 X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

6 Dynalectric $4,385,986.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $109,221.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,505,207.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

7 Neal Electric $4,476,000.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,482,500.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-BB   ELECTRICAL

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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1 FJ WILLERT NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes Yes

2 NATON ENGINEERING $799,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $48,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $872,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes Yes

3 WEST-TECH CONTRACTING, INC NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes Yes

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-CC EARTHWORK

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt Parking Loop Road  Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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N
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O
B

1 KYNE CONSTRUCTION $715,980.00 $1,800.00 $18,000.00 $56,313.00 $0.00 $0.00 $790,293.00 X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

2 STRAIGHTLINE ENGINEERING $619,874.76 $869.47 $8,694.70 $53,566.78 $0.00 $0.00 $682,136.24 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

3 CCL CONTRACTING INC. NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

4
WEST-TECH CONTRACTING , 

INC
$756,139.05 $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $138,081.48 $0.00 $0.00 $924,220.53 X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

5 JPI DEVELOPMENT GROUP, INC. NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

6 INTERPIPE CONTRACTING $1,137,690.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $80,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,218,690.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-FF  SITE UTILITIES

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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R
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N
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B

1 ANGUS ASPHALT $667,480.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $62,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $754,480.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

2 HAZARD CONTRACTING $444,500.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $37,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $507,000.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

3 ABC CONSTRUCTION NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

4 SOUTHLAND PAVING NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 #VALUE! Yes N/R

5 RAP ENGINEERING $494,869.00 $0.00 $0.00 $80,649.00 $0.00 $0.00 $575,518.00 X X X X X X X X X X X Yes N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-GG  ASPHALT PAVING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 

 AWARD
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1 Pacific Coast Cleaning $109,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $109,000.00 X X X X X X N/R N/R

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-HH  FINAL CLEANING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

 Alternate #1  Alternate #2 
GRAND TOTAL 
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B

1 Whitson CM $109,750.50 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $119,750.50 X X X X X X X X X X N/R N/R

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-JJ   EROSION CONTROL

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  



 

Contractors:  Base Bid 
 Unit Cost 

Mob/Demob 

 Total Demob/Remob 

based on 

10 occurances 

 Bid Alt 

Parking Loop 

Road 

GRAND TOTAL 
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1 Landmark Consulting $97,136.00 $1,840.00 $18,400.00 $1,840.00 $117,376.00 X X X X X X X X X X X N/R N/R

2 Trade Name $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/R N/R

PALOMAR COMMUNITY COLLEGE - Palomar South Education Center

CM-15-16-01-SEC-KK    SURVEYING

(PREQUAL REQUIRED)

BID DUE: August 24, 2016 at 2:00 p.m.  


